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Construction Account. All certificates approved by the
Housing and Home Finance Adrninistrator or his author-
ized representative for payments from the Construction
Account as required in this Article shall be retained in its
possession by the Borrower subject at all times to the
inspection of the Adrninistrator and his agents and represent-
atives, and any other interested person.

Moneys in the Construction Account with the Depositary
shall be subject to withdrawal frorn tirne to tirne on the
checks of the Borrower, signed by two officers of the
Borrower, for the purpose of paying arnounts due to con-
tractors or others for the costs of the Project, as defined
in Section 4.OZ hereof , or for reirnbursernent to the
Borrower for payrnents theretofore rnade by the Borrower
for such costs of the Project. The Borrower covenants and
agrees that it wiII not use any of the funds in the Construc-
tion Account for any other purpose than the payrnent or re-
imbursernent of the costs of the Project. The said Depositary
rnay honor such checks and shall have no duty or obligation
to inquire into the purposes for which such withdrawals are
being rnade by the Borrower.

Section 4.04. De sit and Investrnent of Excess Moneys:
Where the rnoneys on dePosit the onstruction Account
exceed the estirnated disbursernents on account of the
project for the next 90 days (3 rnonths), the Borrower rnay
deposit such excess funds in tirne deposits inbanks that are
rnembers of the Federal Deposit Insurance corporation or
rnay invest such excess funds in direct obligations of, or
obligations the principal of and interest on which are
guaranteed by, the united states Governrnent, which shall
rnature, or which are subject to redemption by the holder
thereof at the option of such holder, not later than three
years after the date of such investrnent.

Section 4.05. Application of Balance in Construction Ac-
count: When the Project shall have been cornpleted and


